Imported Items
No|BidNo.

| DD3/P&D/ICB/2019/070/D
DD3/P&D/A/2021/32

2 DD3/P&D/ICB/2019/071/D
DD3/P&D/A/2021/31

—
Procurement Management System - PMS

Ceylon Electricity Board - Djstribution Division 3

Periodic Summary of Awarded Items, 01/07/2021 to 31/07/2021 Annex [
PL No. | Item Name Qty  Supplier Unit FOB Total FOB ~ Freight ~ Local Agent Clearing &
Unit Price Price Comm.(LKR) 2rivery DT
B16091 = Suspension Assembly For ABC 500Nos Sicame Asia Pacific Pte Ltd 27.27 13,635.00 89650  90,851.00  765,000.00
33kV (For 50sqmm G.S. EURO EURO  EURO
Messenger)
B21061 | Insulating Binding Strap (For 20,000 Nos 0.63 12,600.00!
ABC 33kV) EURO EURO
B22601 = Composite Cable Joint Tray C/W 50Nos 180.52 9,026.00
Galvanized Mounting Bracket EURO EURO
for ABC 33kV 3X95+50sqmm
INOPL102ZLARGE ANGLE ASSEMBLY 400/ Set 96.30 38.520.00
FOR ABC 33 KV (FOR 50 EURO EURO
SQMM G.S. MESSENGer)
including messenger continuity
kit
NOPL103 DEAD END ASSEMBLY FOR 150 Set 57.84 8,691.00
ABC 33 KV (FOR 50 SQMM EURO EURO
G.S. MESSENGER) with
messenger continuity kit
NOPL104 Straight through jointing kit for 50Set Foremost Cable Accessories  gpg00  30,000.00 1-200-00  861,792.00  340,000.00
ABC 33KV 3X95 + 50sgmm SDN BHD USD USD USD
including Earth bond messanger
earthing kit
NOPL 105 Termination Kit for ABC 33kV 200 Set 423,00 84.600.00
3X95 + 50 sqmm including Earth USD usD
bond messenger earthing kit
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Ceylon Electricity Board - Distribution Division 3
Periodic Summary of Awarded Items, 01/07/2021 to 31/07/2021

Imported Items

No Bid No. PL No. | Item Name Qty "Sllpplier Unit FOB Total FOB  [Freight  Local Agent Clearing&
Unit Price Price Comm.(LKR) Ch;vr;:; (LKR)
3 DD3/P&D/CB/2019/096/D  NOPL 101 Connector Piercing for ABC 100,000 Nos HEBEI HEINIU ELECTRIC 0.74 7400000 300000 sy S
DD3/PED/AR02L/30 230/400V 54.6-50/10-25 sqmm P IS UsD uspD|  USD
(Identification Code g) 1(-1)11{'éTD

952,643.00 1,555.000.00
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Procurement Management System - PMS



Local Items

Ceylon Electricity Board - Distribution Division 3
Periodic Summary of Awarded Items, 01/07/2021

No Bid No. PL No.

Item Name

1 DD3/P&D/ICB/2020/035/D

2 DD3/P&D/ICB/2020/055/D L08251

Qty Supplier
Unit
L08301 | Aerial Bundled Conductor 100,000m Sierra Cables PLC.

DD3/P&D/A/2021/28 Alu.(ABC) 230/400V 3 x

70+54.6+16sqmm Kaduwela.

Aerial Bundled Conductor Alu. 100,000m Sierra Cables PLC
DD3/P&D/A2021/29 (ABC) 230/400V 3 x 70 +

54.6sqmm Korathota ,

- ‘Kaduwela
Page 1 of 1

Procurement Management System - PMS

to

31/07/2021 Annex 11
Unit Price LKR Total Price LKR  Delivery Charges
(w/o VAT) (w/o VAT) (LKR)
684.05 76,188,957.70 294,000.00
648.99 72,682,982.81 220,000.00
148,871,940.51 514,000.00
DD3/P&D/MMP/RP/04 Rev 00



Imported Items

No : Bid No.

1 DD3/P&D/ICB/2020/006/D
DD3/P&D/A2021/36

2'DD3/P&D/ICB/2020/008/D
DD3/P&D/A/2021/35

Procurement Management System - PMS

Ceylon Electricity Board - Djstribution Division 3

Periodic Summary of Awarded Items, 01/08/2021 to

PL No. |Item Name

Unit

B1605_Z Suspension Assembly for ABC
230/400V (For 70SQMM
Messenger)

B1610_Z Large Angle Assembly for ABC
230/400V ( For 70SQMM
| Messengers)

B1615_Z Dead End Assembly for ABC

| 230/400V (For 70SQMM
Messengers)

BI 820_Z Lugs for ABC Messenger
| 70SQMM

B1825_Z Lugs for ABC 95SQMM

D1220_Z Connector Insulated Phase Cond.
" | For ABC 95SQMM
%D125 0_Z Connector Insulated Neutral
Cond. For ABC 70SQMM

B16151 Dead End Assembly For ABC
230/400V (For 54.6sqmm

Messenger)

Page 1 of 2

31/08/2021 Annex [
e — _ . _ _ )
Qty | Supplier . Unit FOB Total FOB  [Freight Local Agent SIT-‘.”.ng %
| ) ! Price Price Comm. (LKR) C'l:r:\ni::; (LKR)
150 50p Sicame Asia Pacific Pte Ltd 2.85 427.50; 150.00 2,879.48  195,000.00
EURO ! EURO EURO
60 50P 7.17 430.20:
EURO | EURO:
12050P 4.42 530.40
EURO EURO
|
150/50P 321 481.50
' EURO EURO
50/50P | 3.21 160.50:
EURO EURO!
250/50P . 1.27 317.50
i EURO! EURO
75:50P | 3.68 276.00
' EURO ¢ EURO:
USD! USD USD

DD3/P&D/MMP/RP/04 Rev 00



Imported Items

Ceylon Electricity Board - Dijstribution Division 3
Periodic Summary of Awarded Items, 01/08/2021 to 31/08/2021

No Bid No. PL No. ' Item Name ' Qty Supplier Unit FOB Total FOB  iFreight Local Agent Clearing &
Unit Price Price ' Comm.(LKR) Delivery
) ! Chartes (LKR)
3 DD3/P&D/ICB/2020039/D  NopyT1 Hand Operated Hydraulic Press 5 120 Nos| Sicame Asia Pacific Pte Ltd 521.58 62,589.60.  7°0-00  214,642.61 345.000.00
DD3/P&D/A/2021/37 Ton Capacity with Dies ' EURO: EURO: EURO
NOPLT2! Set of Accessories for erection of 120/ Nos 960.37 115,244.40
LV ABC.(Each set of accessories EURO . EURO
shall be completed with 'a' - '¢'
conditions) ;
4 DD3/P&D/ICB/2020/057/D (51411 Insulator Tension Set with l 2,500 Nos Aditya Birla Insulators 29.17 72,931.42% 2,718.00  36,145.45  275,000.00
DD3/P&D/A/2021/34 Hardware 37/2.79 (LYNX)

Procuiement Management System - PMS

, USD UsD!  USD
33kV (70kN) ' '

407,176.04 1,155,000.00
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Ceylon Electricity Board - Distribution Division 3

- Procurement Management System - PMS

Periodic Summary of Awarded Items, 01/09/2021 to  30/09/2021 Annex 1
Imported Items
No | Bid No. PL No. | Item Name Qty | Supplier UnitFOB | Total FOB [Freight  Local Agent  Clearing&
Unit Price Price Comm.(LKR) Delivery
- | Charges (LKE)
DD3/P&D/A/2021/42 1000A (Without Enclosure) N USD UsD|  USD
. |China
\HO08331 | Moulded Case Circuit Breakers 50/ Nos 442.4q 22,120.00
1250A (Without Enclosure) USD USD
|
HO08351 | Moulded Case Circuit Breakers 50 Nos 544.92 27,246.00
1600A (Without Enclosure) USD USD
2|DD3/P&D/ICB2020/059/D 41543 | Service Main Wire Compression | 40,000Nos| Samudra Lanka (Private) 053 2120000 40000 Ll G
DD3/P&D/A/2021/43 Sleeve 7/1.35 mm 16 sqmm2 |L‘m‘ted USD UsD USD
544,043.59 217,000.00
Page 1 of 1 DD3/P&D/MMP/RP/04 Rev 00



Ceylon Electricity Board - Distribution Division 3

Periodic Summary of Awarded Items, 01/09/2021 to 30/09/2021 Annex 11
Local Items
'No| Bid No. PL No. | Item Name Qty Supplier Unit Price LKR | Total Price LKR | Delivery Charges
Unit (w/o VAT) (w/o VAT) (LKR)
| DD3/P&D/A/2021/45
Colombo 04 |
I : | | —
2/DD3/P&D/ICB/2020/070/D L07171 | Cable Cu.PVC Insulated - Single 30,000 m Orel Corporatlon (PV‘t) Ltd 424.72 57,747,904.81 40,000.00
DD3/P&D/A/2021/41 (for earthing) 50sqmm _ .
L07181 | Cable Cu. PVC Insulated - Single | 20,000m | C0lombo 10. 775,877.28
(19/1.78) 50sqmm ; |
76,497,904.81 40,000.00
Page 1 of 1 DD3/P&D/MMP/RP/04 Rev 00

Procurement Management System - PMS



Ceylon Electricity Board - Distribution Division 3

Periodic Summary of Awarded Items, 01/10/2021 to 31/10/2021 Annex |
Imported Items
No | Bid No. ' PL No. | Item Name Qty Supplier Unit FOB Total FOB  |Freight .Lo?al Agent g'elf‘"i“g =
! ! Unit Price Price Comm.(LKR) Cﬁ;:;: (LKR)
1/DDI/PEDACB2020010D 112871 | T - Off Joints Insulated for ABC 80{Nos| Foremost Cable Accessories 346300 277,040.00 -700-00 0.0% 147,500.00
DD3/P&D/A/2021/53 33kV 3x95+50 sqmm b UsD USD UsD
2DD3/P&D/ICB/2020/026/B 01351 Insulator - Pin 33kV 30,000 Nos Dalian Insulator Group T& 13.0( 390’00000 82,10000 0.00| 1,983.”0“_“”
DD3/P&D/A/2021/48 PICoRE USD USD USD
China i |
3|DD3/PED/ICB2020038/D 1516051 | Suspension Assembly For ABC 55,000 Nos| Sicame Asia Pacific Pte Ltd 240 132,000.00 1300.00] 212,341.49|  650,000.00
DD3/P&D/A/2021/47 230/400V (For 54.6sqmm I UsD | USD UsD
Messenger)
B16151 | Dead End Assembly For ABC 30,000/ Nos 2.74 82,200.00
230/400V (For 54.6sqmm USD USD
g Messenger) |
4 DD3/P&D/ICB20200062/D  |g0g151 | Stay Wire G.S. 7/4.00 mm - 25,000kg | Nirmal Wires Pv. Ltd 098 2460000 83000] 24710707 140,000.00
DD3/P&D/A/2021/50 (Grade -700) USD| USD USD
DD3/P&D/A/2021/51 (Grade - 700) USD ‘ UsD UusD
' |
G/RBTREB/ICBA0RT00TD 12901 f Connector Piercing for ABC 350,000 Nos | Hebei Heiniu Electric Power 079 262,500.00 19:000.00 L0 i U0
DD3/P&D/A/2021/49 230/400V 35-70/6 -35 sqmm AENES{CoIIEd . USD USD USD |
China.
DD3/P&D/A/2021/54 (DDLO) 33 kV co. Led, USD UsD Usb
EQ5101 | Carrier - Spare for DDLO 1.250/Nos 13.3§ 16,721.23
Switches 33 kV USD USD
|
| |

rocurement Management System - PMS

Page 1 of 2
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Imported Items

Ceylon Electricity Board - Dijstribution Division 3
to 31/10/2021

Periodic Summary of Awarded Items, 01/10/2021

| PL No.

Unit FOB

scurement Management System - PMS

No | Bid No. Item Name Qty | Supplier Total FOB  |Freight Local Agent g":?ri“g &
| Unit Price Price Comm.(LKR) C:;;g (LKR)
8/ DD3/P&D/ICB/2020/030/D HO4211 g)uFdoor _Three Phase nge 5000 Nog| Asiatic Electrical & e 279 SR 5.675.00 0,00 850,000.00
witch Disconnector for size 2 Switchgear (pvt) Ltd 2
DD3/P&D/A/2021/46 HRC Fuse links with 3 Nos of USD USD USDh
160A HRC Fuse link 2)+solid ‘
link for neutral) |
NOPL21| Operating rods as per clause 125/ Nos ‘ & 1,000.00
5.3.7 of CEB specification USD USD
052:2020 5 B
1,326,475.60 6.040.500.00
Page 2 of 2 DD3/P&D/MMP/RP/04 Rev 00



Imported Items

No Bid No.

PL No. Item Name

Ceylon Electricity Board - Distribution Division 3

Periodic Summary of Awarded Items, 01/11/2021 to

Unit

| DD3/P&D/ICBR020/001D  £oeog

DD3/P&D/A/2021/59

33kV/11kV,10 MV A Outdoor 3

| Phase Power Transformer with
| On Load Tap Changer & Remote

Tap Changer Control Panel

C\Trocv.m—:ment Management System - PMS

30/11/2021 Update on 14/12/2021
Qty Supplier UnitFOB  Total FOB 5Fr-eight " Local Agent g?;?ri"g &
! | o - Price Price Comm.(LKR) Ch;:;g (LKR)
| USD| USD USD
i :Thailand !
B o - 0.00  450,000.00
Page 1 of 1
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Ceylon Electricity Board - Distribution Division 3

Periodic Summary of Awarded Items, 01/11/2021 to 30/11/2021

Local Items

No Bid No. PL No. | Item Name Qty Unit!Su.pplierm
: e _

1'DD3/P&D/ICB/2021/006/D ZT00341 Draw Vice - 2 TON ZSONOS!Monah Traders,

DD3/P&D/A/2(21/57! |
Kirulapane,Colombo 05.
2 DD3/P&DINCB/2020/065/D 1y05051 | Bolts & Nuts - Ungalvanized 40,000 Nos St- Theresa Industries (Pvt) Ltd.

DD3/P&D/A/2G2]/58§ ] 40 x 16mIn . .

'Y05101 Bolts & Nuts - Ungalvanized 20,000 Nes| Heiyanthuduwa

~ 50x 16mm - _ !SriLanka.
Y05201 | Bolts & Nuts - Ungalvanized | 90,000 Nos
- 180 x 16mm
'YO5301 Bolts & Nuts - Ungalvanized . 15,000 Nos
230xl6mm
Y05351 Bolts & Nuts - Ungalvanized 4,000 Nos
- 250 x 16mm .
Y03371 Bolts & Nuts - Ungalvanized 2,000.N05;
280x16om
'Y05401  Bolts & Nuts - Ungalvanized 7,000 Nos
| [ 300x16mm |
'Y05451 | Bolts & Nuts - Ungalvanized 2,00d Nos
350 x 1omm N N 5 R
Q Page 1 of 1

Procurement Management System - PMS

" Unit Price LKR
1 (w/o VAT)

66,100.00

89.00:

98.00
254.00
242.00
323.00ﬂl
35-0t00
377.00_

395.00

Update on : 14/12/2021

Total Price LKR  Delivery Charges

(w/o VAT) (LKR)

16,525,000.00

34,731,000.00

51,256,000.00

DD3/P&D/MMP/RP/04 Rev 00

0.00

0.00

0.00



